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NOTIFICATION

 The following is the Short List containing the Register Numbers of candidates who are found provisionally eligible 
to be included in the Ranked list, subject to the verification of the Original documents, Physical measurement and 
physical  efficiency  test  for  selection  to  the  post  of   WOMEN  POLICE  CONSTABLE(ARMED  POLICE 
BATTALION)  KAP  I(NCA  for  LC/AI)-  Ernakulam  District   (Category  No.  453/2017 )  in  POLICE 
DEPARTMENT on RS.22200-48000 on the basis of the Objective Type Test (OMR) held on 03/03/2018.

The Register Numbers are arranged in their numerical sequence and the arrangement does not in any way, 
indicate their respective rank on the basis of the said test. 
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:

04842314500

DISTRICT OFFICE, ERNAKULAM

Main List

100169 100384 100761 100865 100906 100930

101467 101833 101911 102143 102196 102271

102287 102864 103038 103086 104206 104440

104476 104757 104817 104877 104933 105365

105419 105501 105675 105689 105815 106147

106352 106864 106966 107895 107908 108032

109131 109610 110501 110709 111238 112891

112959 113984 114778 115383 115448 116571

116826 118954

ERNAKULAM
17/11/2018



2 WOMEN POLICE CONSTABLE(ARMED POLICE BATTALION)
  Ernakulam 

Office of the
Kerala Public Service Commission

Approved for issue,

Section Officer.

Note:- (1) Inclusion of Register Numbers in this list is purely provisional  subject to  scrutiny and admission of 
application on absolute basis.  Inclusion of Register  numbers in the short list does not confer any right on the 
candidate  for   inclusion  in the Ranked List.

Note:- (2)  The list has been  prepared by including the number of candidates who have secured top marks in the 
OMR Test. 
Note :- (3)  The candidates who have secured 70 (Seventy ) marks and above are included in the Main List of the 
short list.

Note:- (4)  Candidates included in the short List should present  in person for the Physical Measurement,Physical 
Efficiency Test as specified in the Gazette notification and One Time verification to be conducted before the 
publication of the Ranked list. Date,time and venue of the  Physical Efficiency Test and OTV will be intimated to 
candidates shortly through profile message and SMS. Candidates should download their admission tickets for the 
above tests from the official website “www.keralapsc.gov.in 

Note:- (5)   According to the existing procedure, revaluation of answer scripts is not allowed but answer scripts 
can be rechecked after the publication of Ranked List.  Detailed instructions will be published in the Ranked List 
to be published for the post. 

Note :- (6)  Candidates belonging to Other Backward Classes included in this list who are required to produce 
Non – Creamy Layer Certificate as per G.O (P) No: 81/09/SC/ST/DD dated 26.09.2009 shall produce the same 
along with the other documents mentioned above at the time of verification of original documents.

Note :- (7) Copy of answer  scripts  of the OMR Test held on 03/03/2018 will be issued to those candidates who, 
apply for the same remitting the prescribed fee after approval of the Ranked List.  Candidates whose Register 
Numbers are invalidated are advised to refer to Notification No : ER XVI(2)3492/18/EW Dated 02.11.2018.
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