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NOTIFICATION

 
The following is the Probability List containing the register 

numbers of candidates who found suitable on the basis of the 
result  of the  Objective Type Test (OMR Valuation) held on 
14.10.2011  for  the  post  of  Assistant  Grade  II  /Clerk/Junior 
Clerk/L.D.Clerk/Cashier/Junior  Assistant  (NCA-OX)  in  various 
Companies/Corporations/Boards  owned  by  Government 
notified  in  the  Gazette  dated  29.05.2009  as  category 
No.192/2009.

The  Register  Numbers  are  arranged  in  their  numerical 
sequence and the arrangement does not in any way indicate 
their respective rank.

Each Register Number shall be prefixed by the Alphabet ‘S’ 
indicating State wide.

                
MAIN LIST

200079 200267 200314 200350 200384

200445 200547 200715 200781

Note  I : Inclusion of Register Numbers in this list is purely 
provisional subject to scrutiny and admission of application on 
absolute  basis.  Inclusion  of  Register  Numbers  in  the 
probability list does not confer any right on the candidature 
for subsequent inclusion in the Ranked List.

Note II : The probability list is prepared based on the details 
furnished  by  the  candidates  in  their  application  and 
subsequent claims made will not be entertained at any stage.
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Note III : The candidates who have secured ‘34’ marks and 
above are included in the Probability List.

Note IV :  Candidates included in the probability list should 
produce  in  person  the  original  and  self  attested  copies  of 
documents  to  prove date  of  birth,  community  ,qualification 
and other benefits at the time of verification. Date, time and 
venue  of  certificate  verification  will  be  intimated  in  
due course.

Note  V:  According  to  existing  procedure  revaluation  of 
answer  scripts  is  not  allowed,  but  answer  scripts  can  be 
rechecked  after  the  publication  of  Ranked  List.  Detailed 
instructions  will  be  published  in  the  Ranked  List  to  be 
published for the post.

                                              (By order of the Commission)

                                                                  Sd/-
                                                      REGIONAL OFFICER, 
                                KERALA PUBLIC SERVICE  COMMISSION.
                                              REGIONAL OFFICE, KOLLAM.
 

Approved for Issue,

       Sd/-
Section Officer

GPL/KLRII/Notfn. 


